
 

Proactive Release 

The following documents have been proactively released by the Department of the Prime 
Minister and Cabinet (DPMC): 

 
Annalect Social Media Listening Reports (April 2020 – April 2022) 

 
Early in New Zealand’s pandemic response, a critical need was identified to understand how 
information provided about COVID-19 was being received and understood by the public. 
Public communications about the pandemic had to be effective to ensure that New Zealanders 
were able to comply with legal requirements and guidance on COVID-19 in order to stop the 
spread of the virus. 
  
To this end, the Department of the Prime Minister and Cabinet (DPMC) commissioned regular 
research focusing on sentiment and behaviours towards COVID-19. As part of this, in April 
2020, Annalect, the data analytics division of OMD New Zealand, which is the media buying 
agency for the COVID-19 response, began undertaking social media analysis for the COVID-
19 Group. We did not have this capability ourselves and it would not have been economic or 
timely to build it in-house. Therefore, external providers were sought. Commissioning this 
service was undertaken at pace, given the threat of the emerging pandemic in April 2020.  
 
Organisations, including government departments, have monitored social media for many 
years in order to improve the quality of information they provide to the public 
   
As the pandemic response evolved, tools such as this enabled the COVID-19 Group to be 
agile and adapt communications to address information gaps and the questions and concerns 
of New Zealanders about the COVID-19 response. 
  
The analysis compiled by Annalect helped measure the effectiveness of the Unite Against 
COVID-19 communications and public information campaign as it sought to keep New 
Zealanders informed through the different phases of the response. It enabled the COVID-19 
Group to identify if there were gaps in public understanding about restrictions and public health 
guidelines, and develop tailored communications to address those gaps. 
  
The analysis also provided valuable insights into the impact of pandemic restrictions, New 
Zealanders’ acceptance of them and their willingness to carry out COVID-19 related health 
behaviours. In this sense, the insights have been important in ensuring the safety of our 
communities and maintaining the public trust that is required for an effective response to 
COVID-19. Robust and easily understood public health information has been a key pillar of 
New Zealand’s success in responding effectively to COVID-19.  
  
In compiling the reports, analysts used the Brandwatch Consumer Research tool to observe 
prominent themes regarding the COVID-19 Response, analysing social and digital news 
content on public channels in New Zealand. 
  
The reports provided mostly high-level insights into topics of conversation around COVID-19 
online. This includes the volume of social conversation around a given topic and the sentiment 
of that conversation and how that sentiment changed over time. Annalect also provided 
analysis and commentary on the most prominent issue(s) of the week – for example, if there 
was an Alert Level change, they would analyse conversation around this. This analysis was a 
useful window into the impact of the virus and pandemic restrictions on New Zealanders. 



The reports were refined and adjusted over time to reflect the changing language, landscape 
and focus of the COVID-19 response. In most cases, this was done proactively by Annalect. 
This included the occasional updating of the topics being tracked (for example, introducing 
‘Vaccine Rollout’ when this became a relevant topic of conversation in New Zealand). 
  
The social conversations that were analysed by Annalect came from two sources. The first 
was from engagement with Unite Against COVID-19 (UAC) and Ministry of Health (MoH) 
social media channels, and the second was from content posted publicly elsewhere online, 
from news media, Facebook pages, Twitter, Reddit and other public blogs and forums in 
New Zealand, pulled via keyword searches. Annalect also reported on publicly visible 
engagement with other government pages, such as those of Te Puni Kōkiri and the Ministry 
for Pacific Peoples, in order to understand the questions and concerns of different 
audiences. 
 

The data analysed from UAC social media channels was, in large part, from publicly visible 
comments on UAC social media pages. For two periods in 2020 and 2021, Annalect provided 
a ‘Frequently asked questions’ report, summarising the most asked questions about the 
pandemic and the response online, which included an analysis of questions sent to UAC social 
media channels via direct messages. This was to understand what gaps in public 
understanding existed and what questions and concerns New Zealanders had about COVID-
19, to improve the information being provided to the public via UAC. 
  
During the initial stages of the COVID-19 Vaccine Campaign between May and August 2021, 
analysis of direct messages was also performed on MoH channels for the same reason it was 
on UAC channels, specifically for the vaccine rollout. 
 

In analysing direct messages, Annalect used ‘Sprinklr’, the system the National Crisis 
Management Centre and then DPMC used for managing its social media accounts. Annalect 
were able to generate reports from the system’s reporting dashboard to review sentiment and 
themes from comments and messages being received on the Unite Against COVID-19 and 
Ministry of Health social media channels. 
 
Annalect summarised the most frequently asked questions, and gave examples of these 
questions and others which highlighted prominent themes or issues important to the overall 
response. The analysis of these direct messages to government websites looked at overall 
themes as a guide on which areas of public health information needed strengthening or 
clarifying 
 
At no point in the COVID-19 response has DPMC or Annalect been able to monitor or review 
private conversations or messages between members of the public – nor would we have 
sought access or have means of accessing that information as part of our remit to provide 
high quality public health information about COVID-19 to New Zealanders. 
 

The COVID-19 Group acknowledges the Unite Against COVID-19 website and social media 
channels could have been clearer that communications received may be used for reporting 
purposes. A disclaimer to this effect has been added to all Unite Against COVID-19 channels. 
 
In places in the reports, screenshot examples of public-facing comments from social media 
users were provided by Annalect in order to provide context around the data and the themes 
that were being observed. Good practice required usernames to be redacted, and in later 
reports, so too were users’ profile pictures as part of Annalect’s continuous improvement of 
the reports, which involved refining of the design of the reports and introducing further privacy 



measures. Otherwise, Annalect took steps to ensure that all data in the reports was 
anonymised before it was provided to DPMC. 
  
In New Zealand, Annalect is a division of OMD and sits within OMD’s New Zealand office with 
locally employed analysts. All work is done in New Zealand, by New Zealand-based analysts. 
In undertaking this work, OMD/Annalect were required to uphold New Zealand privacy laws 
when analysing and handling information found in the public domain or through direct 
messages. Annalect analysts all sign individual non-disclosure agreements in relation to this 
work, and OMD/Annalect have their own company-wide non-disclosure agreement that 
covered this work. 
  
In their effort to support the Unite Against COVID-19 campaign by providing analysis of 
conversation online about the pandemic, Annalect made judgement calls as to what to 
provide in the reports, proactively including information they believed would be useful for 
officials to know. 
 
In a small number of reports, Annalect included information not directly relevant to the 
COVID-19 response. On occasion, this included information about politicians and political 
parties. Information not useful to the COVID-19 response was disregarded and Annalect did 
not track the social media profiles of politicians or political parties for DPMC. 
  
It may also be noted that the names of politicians and political parties sometimes appear 
highlighted in the reports. This is because they are listed in the base search query that 
Annalect uses when analysing issues and topics around COVID-19, and they happen to come 
up, from time to time, in the examples of conversations they provide in the reports. Annalect 
did not track mentions of these names for DPMC. 
  
It is important to note the primary use of the reports was internal, informing the COVID-19 
Group’s communications approach. A summary of overall themes and observations were 
sometimes included in external updates and in policy documents, but the reports were not 
provided to Ministers’ offices in full. 
  
As it approached two years since the reports were originally commissioned, DPMC undertook 
a review of the reports and whether they were still required for the next phase of the pandemic 
response. The reports were discontinued in April 2022, as the insights they provided were 
considered to no longer be required as we moved to long-term management of the virus. In 
total, 231 reports were received between April 2020 to April 2022. The total cost of these 
reports was $261,974. 
  
Some parts of this information release would not be appropriate to release in full and, if 
requested, would be withheld under the Official Information Act 1982 (the Act). The information 
that has been withheld from this document has been withheld under section 9(2)(a) of the Act, 
to protect the privacy of individuals. No public interest has been identified that would outweigh 
the reasons for withholding this information. 
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

FAQs 
December 1 - 7, 2020

— Are borders open to tourists now?

— Why are we allowing cricket teams in 

when New Zealanders can’t get quarantine 

rooms?

— Who is paying for non-citizens care 

when/if they end up in hospital?

— When will we have a Trans-Tasman 

bubble?

— When is the government going to 

announce a roadmap to international 

travel?

— How many of the cases are critical?

— Are the 3 community cases NZDF?

— How many days has it been since we have 

had a community case/transmission?

— How many imported cases are from 

Australia?

— Are masks still mandatory on public 

transport?

— Can we have a card/badge/lanyard that we 

carry that signals to others that we cannot 

wear a mask? 

— How do I book in for quarantine/what is the 

process?

— Am I able to apply/pay/request a room with 

specific attributes e.g. opening windows or 

suitable for children?

— Are the public catching COVID in isolation 

facilities?

IMMIGRATION/BORDER CONTROL (20%) MASKS (11%)MIQ (25%) CASES (22%)

SUMMARY: The public have questions about travel and the MIQ process. People are 

asking for specific information about active cases, masks and face coverings.  
Date range Total number of questions 

December 1 - 7 65

November 24 – 30 80

November 17 - 23 97

— TESTING: What is the wait time for results/ 

are tests free?

— COVID TRACER APP: Is it still mandatory 

for businesses to display at QR code?

OTHER
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

Conversation on UAC19 Facebook page
November 24 - 30, 2020

Safety

This conversation indicates a call for safety for 

the nation, and a need to maintain vigilance.

Dobbing, complying, concern, #stayhomeNZ, 

asking for guidelines on social distancing and 

operating safely. 

Health

This conversation expresses a need for more 

support around general health and individuals’ 

wellbeing. Mental health, mentions of abuse, 

violence, concern about suicide.

Households

This category expresses the needs of New 

Zealanders to maintain a happy and healthy 

household and home. Includes custody queries, 

heating and appliance queries, caring for people 

in your household. 

Medical / testing (overlap with Safety)

This conversation is a subcategory of ‘Safety’ 

but expresses calls for specific guidance and 

information. Queries and seeking guidance about 

testing, symptoms and cures. 

Leisure (overlap with Autonomy) 

New Zealanders’ are expressing their need 

for leisure activities. Seeking guidance on 

leisure activities including surfing, fishing, 

boating and more recently team sports.

Personal finance

This conversation consists of concerns about 

financial needs. Commentary and questions 

around individual’s financial stability. Wage 

subsidy guidance.  

Business support

This category is a more general conversation 

about the economy and business-owners 

expressing a need for more governmental 

support. Talk about the economy, and support 

for businesses.

Autonomy

This conversation illustrates New 

Zealanders’ need for freedom and autonomy. 

Restrictions on way of life. Travel and border 

restrictions. Questions and comments about 

what is permissible at different Alert Levels and 

what the timeframe for shifts might be. 

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

Average vol. on page Total vol. on 

page

Average posts on 

page per day

Highest vol. on 

page

L4 (March 25 – April 28) 31,658 904 March 25

L3 (April 29 – May 14) 11,162 697 May 11

L2 (May 15 – June 10) 9,427 349 Jun 8

Time Total vol. on 

page

Average posts per 

day

Highest vol.

Date range: 1 – 7 December 814 116 Dec 2

CATEGORIES OVERTIME

CHART: WEEK TOTALS
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

Category Definitions
We access data through keyword queries. 

We update these queries as the language 

used to describe a topic or theme 

evolves. In this report, keywords have 

been updated to align with changes in 

conversation we’ve observed.

Financial stability 

The impact COVID-19 is having personally on 

New Zealanders in relation to their employment 

situations and personal and/or business 

finances. 

Timeframe

Discussion about how long it will take before 

Alert Level restrictions are lifted or when life 

returns to normal.

Mental health

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about their own mental health and that of their 

families and communities. What support is 

being offered and how are people coping and 

what are their stresses/anxieties.

Way of life

The impact COVID-19 has had on New 

Zealanders' everyday life, including remote 

working and schools, socialising, and changes 

that people have made to adapt to life in the 

pandemic.

#NZPOL Decisions

The nation’s response to and perception of 

New Zealand’s leadership and decisions 

surrounding the response to COVID-19.

Virus

This conversation looks at the virus itself. This 

may include discussion about vaccination, 

medical response, health advice, symptoms of 

COVID-19 and number of cases/deaths in New 

Zealand and globally.

Contact tracing

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about contact tracing and the use of apps and 

other contact tracing methods. 

M E A S U R I N G  C A T E G O R I E S  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N

S O C I A L  C O N V E R S A T I O N  C A T E G O R I E S  O V E R  A  W E E K

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  blogs, 

forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Team of five million / Unite against virus 

Encouraging the nation to rally together, 

comply with the rules and cheerleading the 

cause.

Domestic violence

How are we discussing family violence and 

abuse. How are the domestic violence services, 

agencies and wider community responding 

during this period. 

Enforcement

Responses to the role of official enforcement 

and stories about how infringement is dealt 

with.

Business & consumers

The impact COVID-19 has had on how 

businesses operate and how consumers’ 

behaviour has adjusted to ensure retail / 

hospitality / workplaces run safely.

Economy

Conversations New Zealanders are having 

about the economy, economic decisions and 

upcoming recession and recovery. 

Environmental issues

How are we talking about environmental issues 

including pollution, sustainability/waste and 

water preservation during this time.
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 10

# N Z P O L  D E C I S I O N S

M E N T A L  H E A L T H

E C O N O M Y

B U S I N E S S  &  C O N S U M E R S

T E A M  O F  5  M I L L I O N

E N F O R C E M E N T

F I N A N C I A L  S T A B I L I T Y

V I R U S

C O N T A C T  T R A C I N G

E N V I R O N M E N T A L  I S S U E S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

Please note variations in scale. 

Refer to pages 7 & 8 for category 

volumes. 

T I M E F R A M E

W A Y  O F  L I F E

Data 

missing

Data 

missing

Data 

missing

Data 

missing

Data 

missing

Data 

missing

Data 

missing

Data 

missing
Data 

missing

Data 

missing

Data 

missing
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

FAQs 
December 8 - 14, 2020

— Surely a Tasman bubble is on the cards 

soon?

— When will the NZ govt open a transtasman

bubble with Australia and have no 

quarantine?

— How safe is it for people departing NZ if 

others who are arriving are testing positive 

are walking through the same areas of the 

airport?

— What was the date of the last community 

case?

— I saw there won’t be 1pm announcements 

on certain days. Do we still get to know 

how many cases there are each day even 

if no announcements?

— Did passengers on the same flight as the 

new case need testing?

— When is the government planning to end 

managed isolation? 

— I’m wanting to come back to NZ in 

December – how do I get an isolation 

space?

— Does the app update automatically if you 

have Bluetooth turned on? 

— The app gave me a notification that says

“checking notification keys”. What does 

this mean?

— I’ve turned on the Bluetooth and went out 

– is there a way to see how many 

contacts/people it has identified?

— Does everyone have to turn the Bluetooth 

feature on?

TRAVEL (8%) MIQ (8%)COVID TRACER APP (52%) CASES (12%)

SUMMARY: New Zealanders have questions about the NZ COVID Tracer app’s 

functionality and Bluetooth tracing. People are asking for information about active cases, 

the transtasman travel bubble and the managed isolation process. 

Date range Total number of questions 

December 8 - 15 75

December 1 - 7 65

November 24 – 30 80
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

Conversation on UAC19 Facebook page
December 8 - 14, 2020

Safety

This conversation indicates a call for safety for 

the nation, and a need to maintain vigilance.

Dobbing, complying, concern, #stayhomeNZ, 

asking for guidelines on social distancing and 

operating safely. 

Health

This conversation expresses a need for more 

support around general health and individuals’ 

wellbeing. Mental health, mentions of abuse, 

violence, concern about suicide.

Households

This category expresses the needs of New 

Zealanders to maintain a happy and healthy 

household and home. Includes custody queries, 

heating and appliance queries, caring for people 

in your household. 

Medical / testing (overlap with Safety)

This conversation is a subcategory of ‘Safety’ 

but expresses calls for specific guidance and 

information. Queries and seeking guidance about 

testing, symptoms and cures. 

Leisure (overlap with Autonomy) 

New Zealanders’ are expressing their need 

for leisure activities. Seeking guidance on 

leisure activities including surfing, fishing, 

boating and more recently team sports.

Personal finance

This conversation consists of concerns about 

financial needs. Commentary and questions 

around individual’s financial stability. Wage 

subsidy guidance.  

Business support

This category is a more general conversation 

about the economy and business-owners 

expressing a need for more governmental 

support. Talk about the economy, and support 

for businesses.

Autonomy

This conversation illustrates New 

Zealanders’ need for freedom and autonomy. 

Restrictions on way of life. Travel and border 

restrictions. Questions and comments about 

what is permissible at different Alert Levels and 

what the timeframe for shifts might be. 

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

Average vol. on page Total vol. on 

page

Average posts on 

page per day

Highest vol. on 

page

L4 (March 25 – April 28) 31,658 904 March 25

L3 (April 29 – May 14) 11,162 697 May 11

L2 (May 15 – June 10) 9,427 349 Jun 8

Time Total vol. on 

page

Average posts per 

day

Highest vol.

Date range: 8 - 14 December 645 92 Dec 11

CATEGORIES OVERTIME

CHART: WEEK TOTALS
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

Category Definitions
We access data through keyword queries. 

We update these queries as the language 

used to describe a topic or theme 

evolves. In this report, keywords have 

been updated to align with changes in 

conversation we’ve observed.

Financial stability 

The impact COVID-19 is having personally on 

New Zealanders in relation to their employment 

situations and personal and/or business 

finances. 

Timeframe

Discussion about how long it will take before 

Alert Level restrictions are lifted or when life 

returns to normal.

Mental health

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about their own mental health and that of their 

families and communities. What support is 

being offered and how are people coping and 

what are their stresses/anxieties.

Way of life

The impact COVID-19 has had on New 

Zealanders' everyday life, including remote 

working and schools, socialising, and changes 

that people have made to adapt to life in the 

pandemic.

#NZPOL Decisions

The nation’s response to and perception of 

New Zealand’s leadership and decisions 

surrounding the response to COVID-19.

Virus

This conversation looks at the virus itself. This 

may include discussion about vaccination, 

medical response, health advice, symptoms of 

COVID-19 and number of cases/deaths in New 

Zealand and globally.

Contact tracing

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about contact tracing and the use of apps and 

other contact tracing methods. 

M E A S U R I N G  C A T E G O R I E S  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N

S O C I A L  C O N V E R S A T I O N  C A T E G O R I E S  O V E R  A  W E E K

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  blogs, 

forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Team of five million / Unite against virus 

Encouraging the nation to rally together, 

comply with the rules and cheerleading the 

cause.

Domestic violence

How are we discussing family violence and 

abuse. How are the domestic violence services, 

agencies and wider community responding 

during this period. 

Enforcement

Responses to the role of official enforcement 

and stories about how infringement is dealt 

with.

Business & consumers

The impact COVID-19 has had on how 

businesses operate and how consumers’ 

behaviour has adjusted to ensure retail / 

hospitality / workplaces run safely.

Economy

Conversations New Zealanders are having 

about the economy, economic decisions and 

upcoming recession and recovery. 

Environmental issues

How are we talking about environmental issues 

including pollution, sustainability/waste and 

water preservation during this time.
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T

Net sentiment of each category per week. 

Negative sentiment has increased slightly 

across Enforcement, Contact Tracing, 

#NZPOL Decisions, Way of life and Financial 

Stability. 

All other categories remained stable or 

decreased in negative sentiment. 

Data source: public Facebook pages, 

Twitter, blogs, forums, Reddit in New 

Zealand. 

December 1 – 7, 2020December 8 - 14, 2020
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2020

C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 10

# N Z P O L  D E C I S I O N S

M E N T A L  H E A L T H

E C O N O M Y

B U S I N E S S  &  C O N S U M E R S

T E A M  O F  5  M I L L I O N

E N F O R C E M E N T

F I N A N C I A L  S T A B I L I T Y

V I R U S

C O N T A C T  T R A C I N G

E N V I R O N M E N T A L  I S S U E S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

Please note variations in scale. 

Refer to pages 7 & 8 for category 

volumes. 

T I M E F R A M E

W A Y  O F  L I F E
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2021

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

FAQs 
Dec 15 – Jan 6, 2021

— Why should we turn Bluetooth on?

— How secure is my data?

— When will the app work on my older 

model iPhone/Android?

— My app spends hours looking at 

exposure keys and is using up my 

battery.

— Where do I report business that are not

displaying QR codes?

— If I have Bluetooth system turned on do 

I need to scan?

— Are non-citizens allowed to travel to NZ 

now?

— Will I have to pay for my MIQ.

— Why aren’t the pre flight test required for

other high-risk countries such as India,

South Africa?

— What will your border policies be for 

those who have been vaccinated against 

COVID?

— When will you open borders to 

international students?

— What is in the vaccine?

— Can you share a list of known side-

effects?

— Why haven’t we started vaccinating yet?

— Will the vaccine be mandatory?

— Are we able to chose which vaccine we

receive?

— Are the vaccines effective against the 

new variant in the UK?

— Does this include transiting via UK or 

US?

— Are very young children/babies 

required to have the pre flight test?

— How will I arrange a test in the US or UK 

in time to catch my flight?

— I had COVID and now recovered, 

however my test will come back 

positive. Will this mean I can not travel?

— What does PCR mean?

VACCINE (10%)NZ COVID TRACER APP (19.5%)TRAVEL (28%) BORDER CONTROL (21%)

SUMMARY: New Zealanders had specific questions about travel itineraries and logistics 

due to the introduction of pre travel tests for those coming from the UK & USA. People 

also had more general questions about border policies, including what impact will an 

international vaccination roll out have on New Zealand’s borders. The new Bluetooth 

functionality in the NZ COVID tracer app drew a series of technical questions. Some are 

beginning to ask for more information on vaccination timeframe and potential side-effects.  

OTHER

— Are masks still required on public transport?
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COVID-19 Awareness Study  /  Confidential  / Annalect 2021

Category Definitions
We access data through keyword queries. 

We update these queries as the language 

used to describe a topic or theme 

evolves. In this report, keywords have 

been updated to align with changes in 

conversation we’ve observed.

Financial stability 

The impact COVID-19 is having personally on 

New Zealanders in relation to their employment 

situations and personal and/or business 

finances. 

Timeframe

Discussion about how long it will take before 

Alert Level restrictions are lifted or when life 

returns to normal.

Mental health

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about their own mental health and that of their 

families and communities. What support is 

being offered and how are people coping and 

what are their stresses/anxieties.

Way of life

The impact COVID-19 has had on New 

Zealanders' everyday life, including remote 

working and schools, socialising, and changes 

that people have made to adapt to life in the 

pandemic.

#NZPOL Decisions

The nation’s response to and perception of 

New Zealand’s leadership and decisions 

surrounding the response to COVID-19.

Virus

This conversation looks at the virus itself. This 

may include discussion about vaccination, 

medical response, health advice, symptoms of 

COVID-19 and number of cases/deaths in New 

Zealand and globally.

Contact tracing

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about contact tracing and the use of apps and 

other contact tracing methods. 

M E A S U R I N G  C A T E G O R I E S  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N

S O C I A L  C O N V E R S A T I O N  

C A T E G O R I E S  ( w e e k  t o t a l )

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  blogs, 

forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Team of five million / Unite against virus 

Encouraging the nation to rally together, 

comply with the rules and cheerleading the 

cause.

Domestic violence

How are we discussing family violence and 

abuse. How are the domestic violence services, 

agencies and wider community responding 

during this period. 

Enforcement

Responses to the role of official enforcement 

and stories about how infringement is dealt 

with.

Business & consumers

The impact COVID-19 has had on how 

businesses operate and how consumers’ 

behaviour has adjusted to ensure retail / 

hospitality / workplaces run safely.

Economy

Conversations New Zealanders are having 

about the economy, economic decisions and 

upcoming recession and recovery. 

Environmental issues

How are we talking about environmental issues 

including pollution, sustainability/waste and 

water preservation during this time.
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C A T E G O R Y  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N :  

B R E A K D O W N  &  G R O W T H

Category breakdown: Total weekly volume & percentage 
change in public, social conversation 

Total volume of conversation:

Dec 29 – Jan 4: 346,681

Dec 22 -28: 291,205

Dec 15 – 21: 303,835 (partial data)

Category breakdown excludes data that has not 

been classified. This data contains posts and 

comments outside our key word query for 

example tagging friends, one-word responses 

and so on.

Total conversation: Week ending Mon Jan 4 

Largest segment: Virus 22.6%

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  

blogs, forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Week 

ending
Financial 

Stability

Timeframe Mental Health Way of Life Team of 5 M #NZPOL 

Decisions

Virus

Jan 4 2,010 2.2% 1,320 1.5% 3,367 3.8% 17,061 19.1% 3,101 3.5% 18,025 20.2% 20,188 22.6%

Dec 28 2,634 3.1% 1,118 1.3% 2,870 3.3% 19,989 23.3% 2,679 3.1% 14,937 17.4% 18,133 21.1%

Dec 21 2,895 3.2 1,218 1.3 2,939 3.2% 16,988 18.7% 2,998 3.3% 18,356 20.2% 19,896 21.9%

Week 

ending
Contact Tracing Economy Environmental 

Issues

Domestic 

violence

Enforcement Business & 

consumers

Jan 4 446 0.5% 5,872 6.6% 1,575 1.8% 1,795 2% 6,215 7% 8,372 9.4%

Dec 28 423 0.5% 6,378 7.4% 1,514 1.8% 1,591 1.9% 5,310 6.2% 8,323 9.7%

Dec 21 436 0.5% 7,696 8.5% 1,759 1.9% 1,476 1.6% 5,758 6.3% 8,412 9.3%
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C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 9

# N Z P O L  D E C I S I O N S B U S I N E S S  &  C O N S U M E R S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

E C O N O M Y C O N T A C T  T R A C I N G

E N F O R C E M E N T E N V I R O N M E N T A L  I S S U E S

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 
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C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 10

M E N T A L  H E A L T H

T E A M  O F  5  M I L L I O N

F I N A N C I A L  S T A B I L I T Y

V I R U S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

T I M E F R A M E

W A Y  O F  L I F E

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 

Data 

n/a. 
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O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

FAQs 
January 5 – 18, 2021

— When will MIQ slots for April become 

available to book? 

— I’ve got an existing MIQ booking and 

want to make some updates to it – how 

do I do this?

— Should people be allowed to chat to 

those in MIQ though the fence?

— Does it make a difference to availability 

in MIQ if you request a double or twin 

room?

— With Bluetooth active, do we still need to 

scan the code? 

— My app has never worked and I’m 

unable to reset the password as I don’t 

get the email code. Is there a way to get 

this fixed?

— Since the introduction of the Bluetooth 

functionality, I have had issues with my 

phone connecting to my other Bluetooth 

devices. Has anyone else had this 

issue?

— What does a historical case mean?

— What percentage of travelers returning 

are testing positive?

— What days will be getting case updates 

this week?

— Any updates on the two people that flew 

to Fiji?

— What is the minimum age for children 

requiring a pre-flight test?

— Do I get a test before I fly out of Canada 

or before I fly out of LAX? 

— Which test is required when departing 

the UK?

— Why doesn’t everyone have to have a 

clear test before returning to NZ?

CASES (8%)MANAGED ISOLATION (9%)TESTING (36%) NZ COVID TRACER APP (10%)

SUMMARY: People overseas are seeking clarification about the testing and/or negative 

test result required before flying home. New Zealanders have questions about the NZ 

COVID app functionality, in particular the Bluetooth function. Those wanting to return 

have questions about the MIQ booking process and availability. There are questions about 

case numbers and updates.
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Conversation on UAC19 Facebook page
January 5 - 18

Safety

This conversation indicates a call for safety for 

the nation, and a need to maintain vigilance.

Dobbing, complying, concern, #stayhomeNZ, 

asking for guidelines on social distancing and 

operating safely. 

Health

This conversation expresses a need for more 

support around general health and individuals’ 

wellbeing. Mental health, mentions of abuse, 

violence, concern about suicide.

Households

This category expresses the needs of New 

Zealanders to maintain a happy and healthy 

household and home. Includes custody queries, 

heating and appliance queries, caring for people 

in your household. 

Medical / testing (overlap with Safety)

This conversation is a subcategory of ‘Safety’ 

but expresses calls for specific guidance and 

information. Queries and seeking guidance about 

testing, symptoms and cures. 

Leisure (overlap with Autonomy) 

New Zealanders’ are expressing their need 

for leisure activities. Seeking guidance on 

leisure activities including surfing, fishing, 

boating and more recently team sports.

Personal finance

This conversation consists of concerns about 

financial needs. Commentary and questions 

around individual’s financial stability. Wage 

subsidy guidance.  

Business support

This category is a more general conversation 

about the economy and business-owners 

expressing a need for more governmental 

support. Talk about the economy, and support 

for businesses.

Autonomy

This conversation illustrates New 

Zealanders’ need for freedom and autonomy. 

Restrictions on way of life. Travel and border 

restrictions. Questions and comments about 

what is permissible at different Alert Levels and 

what the timeframe for shifts might be. 

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

Average vol. on page Total vol. on 

page

Average posts on 

page per day

Highest vol. on 

page

L4 (March 25 – April 28) 31,658 904 March 25

L3 (April 29 – May 14) 11,162 697 May 11

L2 (May 15 – June 10) 9,427 349 Jun 8

Time Total vol. on 

page

Average posts per 

day

Highest vol.

Date range: Jan 5 - 18 4,659 332 Jan 15

CATEGORIES OVERTIME

CHART: TOTALS
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Category Definitions
We access data through keyword queries. 

We update these queries as the language 

used to describe a topic or theme 

evolves. In this report, keywords have 

been updated to align with changes in 

conversation we’ve observed.

Financial stability 

The impact COVID-19 is having personally on 

New Zealanders in relation to their employment 

situations and personal and/or business 

finances. 

Timeframe

Discussion about how long it will take before 

Alert Level restrictions are lifted or when life 

returns to normal.

Mental health

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about their own mental health and that of their 

families and communities. What support is 

being offered and how are people coping and 

what are their stresses/anxieties.

Way of life

The impact COVID-19 has had on New 

Zealanders' everyday life, including remote 

working and schools, socialising, and changes 

that people have made to adapt to life in the 

pandemic.

#NZPOL Decisions

The nation’s response to and perception of 

New Zealand’s leadership and decisions 

surrounding the response to COVID-19.

Virus

This conversation looks at the virus itself. This 

may include discussion about vaccination, 

medical response, health advice, symptoms of 

COVID-19 and number of cases/deaths in New 

Zealand and globally.

Contact tracing

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about contact tracing and the use of apps and 

other contact tracing methods. 

M E A S U R I N G  C A T E G O R I E S  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N

S O C I A L  C O N V E R S A T I O N  

C A T E G O R I E S  ( w e e k  t o t a l )

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  blogs, 

forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Team of five million / Unite against virus 

Encouraging the nation to rally together, 

comply with the rules and cheerleading the 

cause.

Domestic violence

How are we discussing family violence and 

abuse. How are the domestic violence services, 

agencies and wider community responding 

during this period. 

Enforcement

Responses to the role of official enforcement 

and stories about how infringement is dealt 

with.

Business & consumers

The impact COVID-19 has had on how 

businesses operate and how consumers’ 

behaviour has adjusted to ensure retail / 

hospitality / workplaces run safely.

Economy

Conversations New Zealanders are having 

about the economy, economic decisions and 

upcoming recession and recovery. 

Environmental issues

How are we talking about environmental issues 

including pollution, sustainability/waste and 

water preservation during this time.
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C A T E G O R Y  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N :  

B R E A K D O W N  &  G R O W T H

Category breakdown: Total weekly volume & percentage 
change in public, social conversation 

Total volume of conversation:

Jan 12 – 18: 264,200

Jan 5 – 11: 308,798

Dec 29 – Jan 4: 346,681

Category breakdown excludes data that has not 

been classified. This data contains posts and 

comments outside our key word query for 

example tagging friends, one-word responses 

and so on.

Total conversation: Week ending Mon Jan 12 

Largest segment: Virus 23.5%

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  

blogs, forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Week 

ending
Financial 

Stability

Timeframe Mental Health Way of Life Team of 5 M #NZPOL 

Decisions

Virus

Jan 18 2,120 2.9% 984 1.3% 2,322 3.1% 12,241 16.7% 2,402 3.2% 13,383 18.3% 17,177 23.5%

Jan 11 1,879 2.3% 1,261 1.5% 2,437 2.9% 13,572 16.6% 2,823 3.4% 15,790 19.3% 18,243 22.4%

Jan 4 2,010 2.2% 1,320 1.5% 3,367 3.8% 17,061 19.1% 3,101 3.5% 18,025 20.2% 20,188 22.6%

Week 

ending
Contact Tracing Economy Environmental 

Issues

Domestic 

violence

Enforcement Business & 

consumers

Jan 18 591 0.8% 5,396 7.4% 1,549 2.1% 2,242 3% 5,524 7.5% 6,956 9.5%

Jan 11 522 0.6% 5,121 6.2% 1,090 1.3% 3,550 4.3% 7,858 9.6% 7,295 8.9%

Jan 4 446 0.5% 5,872 6.6% 1,575 1.8% 1,795 2% 6,215 7% 8,372 9.4%
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C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 9

# N Z P O L  D E C I S I O N S B U S I N E S S  &  C O N S U M E R S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

E C O N O M Y C O N T A C T  T R A C I N G

E N F O R C E M E N T E N V I R O N M E N T A L  I S S U E S
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C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 10

M E N T A L  H E A L T H

T E A M  O F  5  M I L L I O N

F I N A N C I A L  S T A B I L I T Y

V I R U S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

T I M E F R A M E

W A Y  O F  L I F E
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E X P L O R I N G  C O N V E R S A T I O N :  

C O V I D - 1 9  V A C C I N E
13

COVID-19 vaccine - volume of conversation

The total volume of conversation about 

vaccines has remained stable from the 

previous two weeks. The conversation 

looks to be on a slow upwards trajectory.

Please note data is not available for 

January 5. 

Volume of conversation, December 22 – January 4  

Volume of conversation, January 5 - 18
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O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

FAQs 
January 19 - 25, 2021

— What percentage of tests are new 

arrivals vs border workers vs 

community tests? 

— Am wondering what is the time frame is 

for pre-departure tests? 

— If I have been to a location where the 

new Covid case has been but two days 

after do I need to be tested?

— If I have Bluetooth on is that as good as 

signing in?

— When we sign into a place using the QR 

code should we also scan on the way 

out?

— How do I turn on the Bluetooth settings?

— I factory reset my phone and reinstalled 

the app and there is zero history. Does 

that mean all my tracing is lost?

— What about travel to New Zealand once 

you are vaccinated?

— Do you have any indication of what 

stage the proposed border bubble with 

Australia is at?

— I saw that the preventive action to keep 

Cook Island travelers away from other 

international travelers is to have 90min 

between flights. Are these areas being 

thoroughly cleaned between flights?

— When will we know if the case is a new 

strain? 

— Where are they posting all the locations 

she had visited?

— What strain is the UK one?

— Why is she allowed to self isolate? I 

thought all positive cases had to go into 

quarantine/managed isolation

TRAVEL (10%)TESTING (15%)CASES (19%) NZ COVID TRACER APP (15%)

SUMMARY: People have questions about the details of the Northland case. New 

Zealanders are asking about the functionality of the NZ COVID app, in particular 

Bluetooth. There are questions about testing, both in New Zealand and for those wanting 

to return. People are seeking clarification about travel to and from New Zealand. 
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Conversation on UAC19 Facebook page
January 19 - 25

Safety

This conversation indicates a call for safety for 

the nation, and a need to maintain vigilance.

Dobbing, complying, concern, #stayhomeNZ, 

asking for guidelines on social distancing and 

operating safely. 

Health

This conversation expresses a need for more 

support around general health and individuals’ 

wellbeing. Mental health, mentions of abuse, 

violence, concern about suicide.

Households

This category expresses the needs of New 

Zealanders to maintain a happy and healthy 

household and home. Includes custody queries, 

heating and appliance queries, caring for people 

in your household. 

Medical / testing (overlap with Safety)

This conversation is a subcategory of ‘Safety’ 

but expresses calls for specific guidance and 

information. Queries and seeking guidance about 

testing, symptoms and cures. 

Leisure (overlap with Autonomy) 

New Zealanders’ are expressing their need 

for leisure activities. Seeking guidance on 

leisure activities including surfing, fishing, 

boating and more recently team sports.

Personal finance

This conversation consists of concerns about 

financial needs. Commentary and questions 

around individual’s financial stability. Wage 

subsidy guidance.  

Business support

This category is a more general conversation 

about the economy and business-owners 

expressing a need for more governmental 

support. Talk about the economy, and support 

for businesses.

Autonomy

This conversation illustrates New 

Zealanders’ need for freedom and autonomy. 

Restrictions on way of life. Travel and border 

restrictions. Questions and comments about 

what is permissible at different Alert Levels and 

what the timeframe for shifts might be. 

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

Average vol. on page Total vol. on 

page

Average posts on 

page per day

Highest vol. on 

page

L4 (March 25 – April 28) 31,658 904 March 25

L3 (April 29 – May 14) 11,162 697 May 11

L2 (May 15 – June 10) 9,427 349 Jun 8

Time Total vol. on 

page

Average posts per 

day

Highest vol.

Date range: Jan 19 - 25 2,511 358 Jan 24

CATEGORIES OVERTIME

CHART: TOTALS
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Category Definitions

We access data through keyword queries. 

We update these queries as the language 

used to describe a topic or theme 

evolves. In this report, keywords have 

been updated to align with changes in 

conversation we’ve observed.

Financial stability 

The impact COVID-19 is having personally on 

New Zealanders in relation to their employment 

situations and personal and/or business 

finances. 

Timeframe

Discussion about how long it will take before 

Alert Level restrictions are lifted or when life 

returns to normal.

Mental health

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about their own mental health and that of their 

families and communities. What support is 

being offered and how are people coping and 

what are their stresses/anxieties.

Way of life

The impact COVID-19 has had on New 

Zealanders' everyday life, including remote 

working and schools, socialising, and changes 

that people have made to adapt to life in the 

pandemic.

#NZPOL Decisions

The nation’s response to and perception of 

New Zealand’s leadership and decisions 

surrounding the response to COVID-19.

Virus

This conversation looks at the virus itself. This 

may include discussion about vaccination, 

medical response, health advice, symptoms of 

COVID-19 and number of cases/deaths in New 

Zealand and globally.

Contact tracing

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about contact tracing and the use of apps and 

other contact tracing methods. 

M E A S U R I N G  C A T E G O R I E S  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N

S O C I A L  C O N V E R S A T I O N  C A T E G O R I E S  1 9  – 2 5  J A N

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  blogs, 

forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Team of five million / Unite against virus 

Encouraging the nation to rally together, 

comply with the rules and cheerleading the 

cause.

Domestic violence

How are we discussing family violence and 

abuse. How are the domestic violence services, 

agencies and wider community responding 

during this period. 

Enforcement

Responses to the role of official enforcement 

and stories about how infringement is dealt 

with.

Business & consumers

The impact COVID-19 has had on how 

businesses operate and how consumers’ 

behaviour has adjusted to ensure retail / 

hospitality / workplaces run safely.

Economy

Conversations New Zealanders are having 

about the economy, economic decisions and 

upcoming recession and recovery. 

Environmental issues

How are we talking about environmental issues 

including pollution, sustainability/waste and 

water preservation during this time.
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C A T E G O R Y  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N :  

B R E A K D O W N  &  G R O W T H

Category breakdown: Total weekly volume & percentage 
change in public, social conversation 

Total volume of conversation:

Jan 19 – 25: 386,038

Jan 12 – 18: 264,200

Jan 5 – 11: 308,798

Category breakdown excludes data that has not 

been classified. This data contains posts and 

comments outside our key word query for 

example tagging friends, one-word responses 

and so on.

Total conversation: Week ending Mon Jan 25 

Largest segment: Virus 24%

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  

blogs, forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Week 

ending
Financial 

Stability

Timeframe Mental Health Way of Life Team of 5 M #NZPOL 

Decisions

Virus

Jan 25 2,697 2.8% 1,552 1.64% 2,538 2.69% 15,615 16.5% 3,160 3.35% 18,672 19.8% 23,585 24.04

%

Jan 18 2,120 2.9% 984 1.3% 2,322 3.1% 12,241 16.7% 2,402 3.2% 13,383 18.3% 17,177 23.5%

Jan 11 1,879 2.3% 1,261 1.5% 2,437 2.9% 13,572 16.6% 2,823 3.4% 15,790 19.3% 18,243 22.4%

Week 

ending
Contact Tracing Economy Environmental 

Issues

Domestic 

violence

Enforcement Business & 

consumers

Jan 25 1,263 1.34% 6,960 7.4% 1,670 1.77% 1,499 1.77% 6,409 6.8% 8,555 9.1%

Jan 18 591 0.8% 5,396 7.4% 1,549 2.1% 2,242 3% 5,524 7.5% 6,956 9.5%

Jan 11 522 0.6% 5,121 6.2% 1,090 1.3% 3,550 4.3% 7,858 9.6% 7,295 8.9%
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C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 9

# N Z P O L  D E C I S I O N S

M E N T A L  H E A L T H

E C O N O M Y

B U S I N E S S  &  C O N S U M E R S

T E A M  O F  5  M I L L I O N

E N F O R C E M E N T

F I N A N C I A L  S T A B I L I T Y

V I R U S

C O N T A C T  T R A C I N G

E N V I R O N M E N T A L  I S S U E S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

Please note variations in scale. 

Refer to pages 7 & 8 for category 

volumes. 

T I M E F R A M E

W A Y  O F  L I F E
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E X P L O R I N G  C O N V E R S A T I O N :  N O R T H L A N D  C O M M U N I T Y  C A S E 12

Volume of conversation 

Conversation on the UAC page peaked on 

January 24 due to the community case 

announcement and has steadily dropped. 

We have added in January 26 to show this 

decline. 

The average volume of daily posts during 

this time period (January 24 – 26) was 

692. This is just below the Alert Level 3 

average of 697 as can be seen on page 6.  
Volume of conversation on the UAC page, Jan 24 - 26
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O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

FAQs 
January 26 – February 1, 2021

— With long queues at testing stations 

would it be possible to create an online 

registration for people to fill out while 

waiting? 

— All members of my household received 

results back (neg) seven hours ago. I’m 

still waiting for mine despite us all being 

tested at same time – is this common?

— Should we get tested if we were at 

same location as 2 new cases on same 

day or just during the specified times?

— Is it possible to know the percentage of 

users who have Bluetooth on?

— Will you make an app that works on 

Huawei?

— How do we report businesses that are 

not displaying QR codes?

— Bluetooth wasn’t working so I deleted 

and reinstalled the app. Unfortunately, I 

have now lost all of my data. Is there a 

way of getting it back?

— Is there any formal advice regarding 

people leaving MIQ and going directly 

into the community/workplace? 

— Why did 12 people fly straight out of NZ 

after leaving managed isolation?

— Are there plans to create another MIQ 

facility to replace rooms lost at The 

Pullman?

— Where can we find a list of hotels that 

are or have been used for managed 

isolation/quarantine?

— Was there any information whether the 

father/daughter cases were believed to 

be at the beginning or later (historic) 

stages of infection?

— How come Countdown Orewa was 

closed yesterday due to COVID-19? It is 

not on the list. 

— Has it been confirmed how the 

Northland person got it?

— Which Farmers at Albany? The one in 

the mall or at the Megacentre? 

MANAGED ISOLATION (12%)TESTING (14%)CASES (23%) NZ COVID TRACER APP (16%)

SUMMARY: People have questions about details of the recent community cases, 

including the locations they visited. New Zealanders are asking about the functionality of 

the NZ COVID app and businesses displaying QR codes. There are questions about 

testing and wait times. People are asking about MIQ processes and locations. 
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Conversation on UAC19 Facebook page
January 26 – February 1

Safety

This conversation indicates a call for safety for 

the nation, and a need to maintain vigilance.

Dobbing, complying, concern, #stayhomeNZ, 

asking for guidelines on social distancing and 

operating safely. 

Health

This conversation expresses a need for more 

support around general health and individuals’ 

wellbeing. Mental health, mentions of abuse, 

violence, concern about suicide.

Households

This category expresses the needs of New 

Zealanders to maintain a happy and healthy 

household and home. Includes custody queries, 

heating and appliance queries, caring for people 

in your household. 

Medical / testing (overlap with Safety)

This conversation is a subcategory of ‘Safety’ 

but expresses calls for specific guidance and 

information. Queries and seeking guidance about 

testing, symptoms and cures. 

Leisure (overlap with Autonomy) 

New Zealanders’ are expressing their need 

for leisure activities. Seeking guidance on 

leisure activities including surfing, fishing, 

boating and more recently team sports.

Personal finance

This conversation consists of concerns about 

financial needs. Commentary and questions 

around individual’s financial stability. Wage 

subsidy guidance.  

Business support

This category is a more general conversation 

about the economy and business-owners 

expressing a need for more governmental 

support. Talk about the economy, and support 

for businesses.

Autonomy

This conversation illustrates New 

Zealanders’ need for freedom and autonomy. 

Restrictions on way of life. Travel and border 

restrictions. Questions and comments about 

what is permissible at different Alert Levels and 

what the timeframe for shifts might be. 

O W N E D  C H A N N E L S

Average vol. on page Total vol. on 

page

Average posts on 

page per day

Highest vol. on 

page

L4 (March 25 – April 28) 31,658 904 March 25

L3 (April 29 – May 14) 11,162 697 May 11

L2 (May 15 – June 10) 9,427 349 Jun 8

Time Total vol. on 

page

Average posts per 

day

Highest vol.

Date range: Jan 26 – Feb 1 3,991 570 Jan 28

CATEGORIES OVERTIME

CHART: TOTALS
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Category Definitions

We access data through keyword queries. 

We update these queries as the language 

used to describe a topic or theme 

evolves. In this report, keywords have 

been updated to align with changes in 

conversation we’ve observed.

Financial stability 

The impact COVID-19 is having personally on 

New Zealanders in relation to their employment 

situations and personal and/or business 

finances. 

Timeframe

Discussion about how long it will take before 

Alert Level restrictions are lifted or when life 

returns to normal.

Mental health

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about their own mental health and that of their 

families and communities. What support is 

being offered and how are people coping and 

what are their stresses/anxieties.

Way of life

The impact COVID-19 has had on New 

Zealanders' everyday life, including remote 

working and schools, socialising, and changes 

that people have made to adapt to life in the 

pandemic.

#NZPOL Decisions

The nation’s response to and perception of 

New Zealand’s leadership and decisions 

surrounding the response to COVID-19.

Virus

This conversation looks at the virus itself. This 

may include discussion about vaccination, 

medical response, health advice, symptoms of 

COVID-19 and number of cases/deaths in New 

Zealand and globally.

Contact tracing

What conversations are New Zealanders having 

about contact tracing and the use of apps and 

other contact tracing methods. 

M E A S U R I N G  C A T E G O R I E S  O F  C O N V E R S A T I O N

S O C I A L  C O N V E R S A T I O N  C A T E G O R I E S  J A N  2 6  _  F E B  1

Data source: public Facebook pages, Twitter,  blogs, 

forums, Reddit in New Zealand. 

Team of five million / Unite against virus 

Encouraging the nation to rally together, 

comply with the rules and cheerleading the 

cause.

Domestic violence

How are we discussing family violence and 

abuse. How are the domestic violence services, 

agencies and wider community responding 

during this period. 

Enforcement

Responses to the role of official enforcement 

and stories about how infringement is dealt 

with.

Business & consumers

The impact COVID-19 has had on how 

businesses operate and how consumers’ 

behaviour has adjusted to ensure retail / 

hospitality / workplaces run safely.

Economy

Conversations New Zealanders are having 

about the economy, economic decisions and 

upcoming recession and recovery. 

Environmental issues

How are we talking about environmental issues 

including pollution, sustainability/waste and 

water preservation during this time.
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C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T

Net sentiment of each category per week. 

‘Way of life’, ‘Timeframe’, ‘Environmental 

Issues’ and ‘Enforcement’ categories 

became more negative, while NZPOL, 

‘Business & Consumers’ and ‘Mental Health’ 

became less negative. All other categories 

remained stable.                

Data source: public Facebook pages, 

Twitter, blogs, forums, Reddit in New 

Zealand. 

Jan 19 - 25, 2021Jan 26 – Feb 1, 2021
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C A T E G O R Y  S E N T I M E N T 10

# N Z P O L  D E C I S I O N S

M E N T A L  H E A L T H

E C O N O M Y

B U S I N E S S  &  C O N S U M E R S

T E A M  O F  5  M I L L I O N

E N F O R C E M E N T

F I N A N C I A L  S T A B I L I T Y

V I R U S

C O N T A C T  T R A C I N G

E N V I R O N M E N T A L  I S S U E S

Categories with typically low volume 

excluded as sentiment skews. 

Please note variations in scale. 

Refer to pages 7 & 8 for category 

volumes. 

T I M E F R A M E

W A Y  O F  L I F E
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